
From: henninbk
To: Dusty Pilkington
Cc: r_henning@hotmail.com
Subject: Re: Link to Shoreline Exemption Form
Date: Saturday, September 10, 2016 1:58:10 PM

Sorry. I did not mean any disrespect.  
I don't like auto text sometimes. 

Sent from my Verizon 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------
From: henninbk@aol.com 
Date: 9/10/16 11:33 AM (GMT-08:00) 
To: dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us 
Cc: r_henning@hotmail.com, henninbk@aol.com 
Subject: Re: Link to Shoreline Exemption Form 

Thanks Dusty, Excuse my sticker shock. I meant to disrespect to you personally.
I have filled out the Shoreline exempt form. Looks to me it was just page 1-3 for use to fill out and 4-6
is for the county to complete. Did I see that correctly? I saw the For staff only on top of page 4. If not I
can get the other pages filled out and e-mail those to you.
As far as the form I have filled out I will be putting it in the mail Monday 9/12. I will have it sent priority
mail Attention to you with check and signatures enclosed.
I have also printed out every other form that I have submitted to the WDFW and the Army corp. I have
also printed all the drawing that have been submitted. These are also attached. I am trying to give you
as much information as I can up front. Thought that it would help move this along.
My HPA was denied because the state said I needed a SEPPA. Brent is currently looking into this and
says I should not need one if I get exemptions from the county and the corp. I already have the corps
approved as you will see in the package you will be receiving this week.
Please feel free to contact me anytime or my father.
Hope this is helpful and look forward hearing from you.
 
Brian Henning
206-478-1860
 
Ronal Henning
206-459-1943
 
 
 
 
 
-----Original Message-----
From: Dusty Pilkington <dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us>
To: henninbk <henninbk@aol.com>
Sent: Thu, Sep 8, 2016 4:46 pm
Subject: RE: Link to Shoreline Exemption Form

Mr. Henning,
 
I am sorry, but those are the processing fees.  A shorelines permit processing fee would be 2,165 if
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SEPA was not required. Please feel free to contact me with further questions.
 
 
 
 
 
 
Dusty Pilkington
Planner I
Kittitas County Community Development Services
411 N Ruby St # 4, Ellensburg, WA 98926
(509) -962-7079
dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us
 
 
 
From: henninbk@aol.com [mailto:henninbk@aol.com] 
Sent: Thursday, September 08, 2016 4:06 PM
To: Dusty Pilkington
Cc: r_henning@hotmail.com
Subject: Re: Link to Shoreline Exemption Form
 
Dusty--
Am I reading this correctly that we need to pay a $830 or $1500 permit fee to replace rock that was
washed away from our property? Please tell me that is for a shoreline permit and not for the
exemption. Please.
 
 
-----Original Message-----
From: Dusty Pilkington <dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us>
To: henninbk <henninbk@aol.com>
Sent: Tue, Sep 6, 2016 10:34 am
Subject: Link to Shoreline Exemption Form

Mr. Henning,
 
Below is a link to the shoreline exemption form. Thanks!
 
Shoreline Exemption Form
 
Dusty Pilkington
Planner I
Kittitas County Community Development Services
411 N Ruby St # 4, Ellensburg, WA 98926
(509) -962-7079
dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us
 
 
 
 

Notice: All  email sent to this address will be received by the Kittitas County

mailto:dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us
mailto:henninbk@aol.com
mailto:henninbk@aol.com?
mailto:r_henning@hotmail.com
mailto:dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us
mailto:dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us
mailto:henninbk@aol.com
mailto:henninbk@aol.com
https://www.co.kittitas.wa.us/uploads/documents/cds/forms/Shoreline-Exemption-Permitting.pdf
mailto:dusty.pilkington@co.kittitas.wa.us


email system and may be subject to public disclosure under Chapter 42.56
RCW and to archiving and review.
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